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Aon plc (NYSE: AON) exists to shape decisions for the better — to
protect and enrich the lives of people around the world. Our colleagues
provide our clients in over 120 countries with advice and solutions that
give them the clarity and confidence to make better decisions to protect
and grow their business.

Recruitment: We focus our campus recruiting effort in the fall quarter,
from September to November.

Office Locations: We represent the Southern California offices in Irvine
and Los Angeles; we are recruiting for actuarial talent nationwide.

Please stop by and chat with us! Please also visit our website dedicated to
early career opportunities at https://www.aon.com/careers/early-careers.

For more than 80 years, Blue Shield of California has been dedicated to
transforming health care by making it more accessible, cost-effective, and
customer-centric. We are a not-for-profit health plan with 7,100
employees, $25 billion in annual revenue, and 4.8 million members, and we
are proud to have invested over $77 million in California communities
over the last 3 years through the Blue Shield of California Foundation.

As health care continues to evolve, we’re looking for people who are
passionate about bringing meaningful change. We want you to help
transform our industry and achieve our mission to ensure that
Californians have access to high-quality health care at an affordable price.

If you’re interested in learning more about our mission and values, please
visit www.blueshieldca.com/about/corporate-info/mission-values.

Recruitment: We offer a comprehensive 10-week summer internship
program as well as entry-level roles. Recruiting begins now, and students
are encouraged to apply on our career site.

Office Locations: Blue Shield employees can be found across California
working in both hybrid and remote roles. Our corporate headquarters are
in Oakland, but we have several offices spread throughout the state, from
San Diego and Los Angeles up to Oakland and Sacramento.

https://www.aon.com/careers/early-careers
https://www.blueshieldca.com/about/corporate-info/mission-values
http://www.blueshieldca.com/careers


Centene Corporation is the largest Medicaid managed care organization in
the country, providing our members access to affordable healthcare plans.
Ranked No. 22 on the 2024 Fortune 500 list, our purpose of transforming
the health of our communities is achieved through a commitment to local
partnerships, which help us provide better health outcomes at lower costs.
Centene provides high quality, whole health solutions for our diverse
membership by recognizing the significance of the many different cultures
our members represent and by forming partnerships in communities that
bridge social, ethnic, and economic gaps. We believe that quality healthcare
isn’t just responding to an illness but empowering our members by
providing them the tools to make informed decisions for better health
outcomes. We offer options suited for each member’s unique healthcare
needs, whether through government programs like Medicaid and
Medicare, or through the Health Insurance Marketplace. Our focus on
whole health, including behavioral health, dental and vision, pharmacy,
and more, is helping us change the world of healthcare and transform our
communities.

Recruitment: Applications for internships are accepted whenever roles are
posted on our jobsite between August-April. If you are looking for a
full-time position, please apply closer to your graduation date. If the
position requires a bachelor’s degree prior to consideration, wait until that
time or you will not be considered as meeting minimum requirements for
the role.

Our general job site can be found at the following link:
www.jobs.centene.com

To search for internships and entry level roles, please navigate to the
“Students & Grads” portion of the job site, found at:
https://jobs.centene.com/us/en/students

You can sign up for related job alerts to receive job postings whenever
new relevant jobs are open and posted.

Office Locations: We represent the Woodland Hills, CA office. Other
offices that are recruiting: Chicago/Tampa/Clayton/various in
Arizona/other TBDs/remote.

http://www.jobs.centene.com
https://jobs.centene.com/us/en/students


At Corebridge Financial, we believe everyone deserves financial security.
We help people take action toward their future goals with our broad suite
of retirement solutions and insurance products. Corebridge is one of the
largest and most established providers of retirement solutions and
insurance products in the United States, with a long and proven track
record of serving our clients.

Our balanced portfolio across the Corebridge enterprise—Individual
Retirement, Retirement Services, Life Insurance and Institutional
Markets— enables us to manage risk, maximize growth opportunities, and
help drive positive outcomes for those we serve. We proudly partner with
financial professionals and institutions to make it possible for more people
to take action in their financial lives for today and tomorrow. For more
information, visit http://www.corebridgefinancial.com/.

Recruitment: The application is currently open on our website. We are
looking to host our interviews at the end of October/early November.

Members can apply online at our website. If a candidate application is
selected for a 1st round interview, they will be sent a HireVue video
interview. If a candidate is selected for a final interview they will be invited
to participate in our interview super day.

The internship is a 10-week hybrid program starting in June. During their
internship they will participate in a cohort project, a leadership speaker
series, and various office events (townhalls, socials, volunteer events, etc.).

Office Locations: Our Colleagues represent the Houston, Jersey City and
Woodland Hills Offices (these are also the offices we are recruiting for).

Mercer delivers advice and technology-driven solutions that redefine the
world of work, reshape retirement and investment outcomes, and unlock
real health and well-being.

Recruitment: All open roles can be found on our careers website, but
below are direct links to Actuary roles! The application deadline is
October 13th at 11:59pm EST.

• Health Consulting Actuary Intern – West Coast
• All Early Career Roles – National

Office Locations: West Coast: San Francisco, Los Angeles, Irvine, Denver.

http://www.corebridgefinancial.com/
https://careers.marshmclennan.com/global/en/mercer


Elevance Health, formerly known as Anthem, Inc., is a leading health
company dedicated to improving lives and communities. It operates as a
health benefits company, offering a broad range of medical and specialty
products and services, including health, dental, vision, and pharmacy
benefits, as well as life insurance and disability insurance. Through its
subsidiaries and affiliated companies, Elevance Health serves millions of
members across the United States, focusing on innovative solutions to
enhance healthcare access, affordability, and quality. The company
collaborates with physicians, hospitals, and other healthcare providers to
deliver comprehensive care and support for its members, aiming to create
a positive impact on broader public health outcomes.

Recruitment: While we fill most of our entry-level positions in the fall,
additional positions do become available throughout the year, including in
the spring. We strongly encourage graduating students and recent
graduates to check our career page
(https://careers.elevancehealth.com/careers/) and search for 'actuarial' to
view available positions!

One SOA exam is required for full-time opportunities (preliminary results
count, too!). Elevance Health does not offer H1B visa support.

Office Locations: We represent the Woodland Hills office, but candidates
can choose from several locations with a significant actuarial presence to
start their careers at Elevance Health:

• Woodland Hills, CA
• Indianapolis, IN
• Atlanta, GA
• Denver, CO
• St. Louis, MO
• Waukesha, WI
• Norfolk, VA
• Richmond, VA
• New York, NY
• Mason, OH
• Louisville, KY
• Wallingford, CT

https://careers.elevancehealth.com/careers/


Horizon Actuarial is a leading actuarial consulting firm, specializing in
multiemployer plans benefits (mostly Taft-Hartley plans). We provide
trusted advice to over 150 multiemployer retirement and health plans
across a wide range of industries, serving nearly 2.5 million participants.

Recruitment: Horizon Actuarial’s recruiting schedule is generally unlike
larger firms in that we take a personalized approach to recruiting. Please
connect with us to start the conversation.

If you have any questions about what we do or the industry we serve, or if
you would like to connect with us to continue the conversation, you can
email any one of us directly (firstname.lastname@horizonactuarial.com).
You can also send your resume and cover letter to
careers@horizonactuarial.com.

Office Locations: While we tend to seek experienced associates, our main
offices (Los Angeles, Silver Spring, and Atlanta) seek exceptional talent for
possible internships and entry-level positions.

The Cigna Group is a global health company committed to creating a
better future built on the vitality of every individual and every community.
Through our divisions Cigna Healthcare and Evernorth Health Services,
we are dedicated to providing whole-person services and solutions.

Students can go here to learn more about our actuarial program.

Recruitment: Students are welcome to apply now! - Our application cycles
tend to run late August/early September through October/early
November (depending on how slots fill up through the fall).
We encourage UCLA students to visit any of these links if they would like
to apply or even just learn more prior to us being at the career fair:

• Full-Time Job Posting
• Internship Posting (Undergrad students)
• Internship Posting (Masters/PhD)

Office Locations: Our colleagues come from the Nashville and Denver
offices, respectively - however, we represent the entire AEDP which hires
for the following locations:

• Austin, Texas (intern only)
• Bloomfield, Connecticut
• Denver, Colorado
• Nashville, Tennessee (intern only)
• Philadelphia, Pennsylvania

mailto:careers@horizonactuarial.com
https://jobs.cigna.com/us/en/actuarial-executive-development-program
https://jobs.thecignagroup.com/us/en/job/24011066/Actuarial-Executive-Development-Program-Actuarial-Senior-Analyst-Hybrid?userId=RECRUITERTue+Aug+13+14:22:22+UTC+2024&&utm_term=RECRUITERTue+Aug+13+14:22:22+UTC+2024
https://jobs.thecignagroup.com/us/en/job/24011070/Actuarial-Internship-Undergrad-On-site?userId=RECRUITERTue+Aug+13+15:32:27+UTC+2024&&utm_term=RECRUITERTue+Aug+13+15:32:27+UTC+2024
https://jobs.thecignagroup.com/us/en/job/24011072/Actuarial-Internship-Masters-PhD-On-site?userId=RECRUITERTue+Aug+13+15:32:27+UTC+2024&&utm_term=RECRUITERTue+Aug+13+15:32:27+UTC+2024


Oliver Wyman Actuarial Consulting, Inc. (Oliver Wyman) is an operating
division of the Oliver Wyman Group, a member of the Marsh &
McLennan Companies (MMC), the foremost employer of actuaries in the
world. Oliver Wyman draws on an extensive pool of global capabilities and
experience to serve clients worldwide.

Our property and casualty practice has assisted insurance companies,
self-insured corporations, government entities and other organizations
with all aspects of managing property and casualty insurance exposures
since 1986. Our highly credentialed actuaries bring to the table
wide-ranging expertise and deep knowledge of actuarial science, risk and
insurance. With offices throughout North America, we combine a broad
perspective with the local connection required to optimally serve our
clients' business needs.

Oliver Wyman provides a competitive compensation and benefits package,
including an Actuarial Study Program.

Recruitment: While there is no particular standing annual recruiting
schedule, Oliver Wyman remains regularly and actively engaged in
recruitment efforts to meet the demands of our rapidly growing practice.

Please feel free to visit our website to learn more about our world famous
actuarial practice and the existing culture that is Oliver Wyman! Please see
link above for applying for career opportunities or visit directly with our
representatives at the upcoming career fair.

Office Locations: Our colleagues will represent the West Zone Region of
Oliver Wyman, which includes the Los Angeles and San Francisco offices
where we have multiple entry level openings. For other offices offering
entry level opportunities, please visit our website for more information.

Milliman, Inc.
For 75 years, Milliman has combined technical expertise with business
acumen to create elegant solutions for our clients. Today, we are helping
organizations take on some of the world's most critical and complex
issues, including climate change, retirement funding and healthcare
financing, risk management and regulatory compliance, data analytics and
business transformation. Our mission is to serve our clients to protect the
health and financial well-being of people everywhere.

Recruitment: Refer to our Milliman careers website for job openings.

Office Locations: We represent the Property and Casualty practices of San
Francisco and Pasadena. Milliman has 4 disciplines (retirement & benefits,
health, life & financial services, P&C) and we have actuaries working in all
4 disciplines.

https://www.oliverwyman.com/our-expertise/capabilities/actuarial.html
https://www.oliverwyman.com/careers/consulting.html


Milliman Seattle Health
Founded in 1947, we are an independent risk management, benefits and
technology firm with offices in major cities around the globe. We are
empowered by the diversity of our backgrounds, driven by a shared
commitment to innovate, and inspired by a common mission: to serve our
clients to protect the health and financial well-being of people everywhere.

Recruitment: Fall recruiting for Summer 2025 Actuarial Analyst Interns
and full-time Actuarial Analysts. Winter recruiting for Fall 2025 Actuarial
Analyst Interns. Summer recruiting for Winter 2026 Actuarial Analyst
Interns. We have year round internship opportunities and consider
students and graduates for our internship program.

Office Locations: We represent the Seattle Health practice of Milliman,
located in Seattle, WA.

For more than 150 years, Pacific Life has offered innovative products and
services including life insurance, annuities, and mutual funds, along with a
variety of investment products, all of which provide The Power to Help
You Succeed. We firmly believe each employee plays a part in our
continued growth and success, and we pride ourselves in providing a work
environment that is challenging, inclusive, collaborative, and
results-oriented. With a powerful past and a strong future, Pacific Life
offers an environment where you’re empowered to achieve your personal
best. In return, we look to your passion and insight to help us grow. For
additional company information, including current financial strength
ratings, visit www.PacificLife.com.

Recruitment: The application is now live on our careers site at
https://www.pacificlife.com/home/Careers.html.

You can apply here.

Office Locations: Firm reps are representing the Newport Beach, CA
office. We are currently hiring for our two main offices Newport Beach,
CA and Omaha, NE.

http://www.pacificlife.com/
https://www.pacificlife.com/home/Careers.html
https://pacificlife.wd1.myworkdayjobs.com/en-US/PacificLifeCareers/details/Summer-2025-Actuarial-Intern--Newport-Beach-_R12871?q=intern


At WTW (NASDAQ: WTW), we provide data-driven, insight-led
solutions in the areas of people, risk and capital. Leveraging the global
view and local expertise of our colleagues serving 140 countries and
markets, we help you sharpen your strategy, enhance organizational
resilience, motivate your workforce and maximize performance. Working
shoulder to shoulder with you, we uncover opportunities for sustainable
success—and provide perspective that moves you.

Come join Willis Towers Watson (WTW) to learn more about our
company and the exciting opportunities at WTW! WTW is a leading global
advisory, broking and solutions company that helps clients around the
world turn risk into a path for growth. With roots dating to 1828, WTW
has over 44,000 employees serving more than 140 countries and markets.
Our values are more than words. A strong client focus, an emphasis on
teamwork, unwavering integrity, mutual respect and a constant striving for
excellence are at the core of WTW’s rich history. At WTW, we provide
data-driven, insight-led solutions in the areas of people, risk and capital
that make organizations more resilient, motivate workforces, and
maximize performance. We work shoulder to shoulder with our clients,
bringing diverse points of view and a deep commitment to their success.
By challenging one another, we achieve breakthroughs because only the
best ideas survive. The result? Innovative solutions that meet clients’
needs—informed by the global view and the local understanding of our
colleagues around the world. Together, we broaden your horizon and
sharpen your focus. Managing people, risk and capital to propel the
world’s leading businesses forward. This is the perspective that moves you.

Recruitment: Our roles are open on our website:
https://careers.wtwco.com/job-search-results/. (To review all of the
internship roles available to students, search the word “Internship” or
“Intern” in the “Find A Job” search bar. To review all of the full-time
roles available to graduating students, search the word “Early Careers."
You can also search by exact job titles and then filter down by location.)

Office Locations: We are a global company with multiple locations in the
US. Locations in California are LA, Irvine and San Francisco.

https://careers.wtwco.com/job-search-results/


Rael & Letson is an independent employee benefits consulting and
actuarial services firm. We serve as a trusted advisor to multiemployer and
other retirement and health plans, helping to bring high quality benefits to
working people. We partner with our clients to design, implement, evaluate
and communicate cost-effective benefit programs customized to their
unique needs. Please visit our website at www.rael-letson.com/ for more
information and to apply to open positions.

Recruitment: Rael & Letson doesn’t have a set recruiting schedule. Instead,
we recruit on an as-needed basis and always accept resumes so when we
have a need we can reach out.

Members can apply on our website at www.rael-letson.com/. Note that we
typically do not hire interns.

Office Locations: All three attending the career fair represent our San
Diego office. We also have offices in San Mateo, CA, Seattle, WA and
Honolulu, HI.

https://www.rael-letson.com/
https://www.rael-letson.com/

